T4 JdaEES www.govtpressmp.nic.in
¥ +ft T elre forar s wewar 2.

SHF 36] fiuret, YERAR, TR 19 SFad 2018—W 29, ¥H 1939

fafy siw faur =l fasm

0, fediw 19 SHad 2018

. 1124-18-39RIE-81 (W1.).—WRA & WM % AT 213 % el ALY & ToIUA GRI
wetya fear T Freafafaa sy gduERe w5 SRR 7 Tehiea feRar S R,

| e ¥ TSI % A A A1 STRYIER,
TIT areE, SAfaiaa dfda.

71



72

ey IN9d, fediw 19 sFad 2018

e .

weueyT stufrm
®HH R WA
2e4E a9
stfufram wwisk
2 T ¢RE&QL I
AT ®A W
dynfaa fear
.

HeayesT ATfutrm
®ATHE I T
LRUE ST HTIEF.

HeAYAIT TLATSIT
HHF 3 T 02
HEAWAYT RUMeTeR fafdr (E9er ) @I, 08¢
[ “weauer Teras (3raremor)” § fAiR ¢ SFEdl, Rote I WUWER WehiivE feRem T,

NG TS o 3TeHad oy # Usaulel g Feamud feham 7.

HEITReT TRATE BT SfUREE, Qus AT MEAWRST RUNSRET JfufEm, 238 @Y i
Ayt & ¥ A

T, T F faum-Hed w1 o 9 T € AR qeAuy F TuE w1 A% wEEH 8 W ® 6
U Rl formm €, e ROT 97 Smavers € T § R 3 gl sieE ®Y;

STE, G F WM % S 223 F WU () BN WS WHA H WA H AW g, HALATY
¥ TS Frefefiad SRy yenfyd 3 € o—

9. TH TRV 1 UW A HeAyey TRufes fafd (TeiEA) TRy, 08¢ ©

. TH THARY ¥ Yafdd WA i HEy & SNHE, TRy TRufas i sifufEm, jug
(FHF I3 T IQ4E) T AEIIRE TRUMEH SfufEm, 336 (FHiF 30 T ]&R) W 3 3R ¥
# fafafdy deiedl % oreaefiv WA g 9wET B

IAT-Teh
WeAgeyl TRt fm aififem, gjus (hHiw 3 W%%ka)mﬁvﬁm

3. MYy TR I afultEm, 3qus (U 33 T R]UE) T, 9T R33-% H, IUMM
(2) #,—
(T%) wisg Q) yigwe! F WE W v i faea’’ enfia fe

() vz TRaTfere TR YS9 YRR Wi B STell Yok ht TP T IR STHIETE foreh
F gfEIeErsT & frafed w0 | reen TE afEsmstl & fraraem & foad deifya
TR FATH gRT 31eren I9eh) 3R 9 fore T won =t wfader &3 o foran smam.
F WH W, I TH YHR T S aredl Yok i R H WA TR &5 H T
sterECa foremr, T smarg aftEisiel, B2 Y@ w1 aftafag % gY T
oftaes o1 Tt o ufEisFel % ford fman ST Ooh . 39 WRR ST Tfd 1 S
I Sfeafiga uftEierell % fraream *q faw T = & i & ford of fwar.
1 g, wenfya feu e,



Ty Tovd, f&iw 19 SHed 2018 72 (1)

q-q
HEAYAYT WRUTIeTeRT AW, 282 (THHIH 39 T &R ) Tl WINeA

¥, HEAYSY TRAer Sifufiam, 963 (ShHiw 30 T RRER) H, ¥ &R H, IUMW (R) H,—  wewdw afufrem
FUH 39 T
2]% ¢ T HYNEA,

() weg ' i’ F ©H R, Wk A iowa’” ifia fe g

() v R IR 91 TR qREE F 39 TER 9T B a1l Yook Uik 6 e
STeEE e w1 afEsrell o frarfaa = B steran Tt ufeisHeh % fraraas
¥ ford eiftra Trearferer afteg a1 R AR gRT Stere IEH! oK ¥ fag e o
o gl w3 fra Smum'’, % wF W, UK 39 TER 9| R Al Yooh i
¥t =7 ST 0 & § 1 SreiEE T, fRered stare ufEseset, At
& ® wftafod @ g T uftaed o1 T e el & ol foan s @
T YHR I AR w1 ST Sww Sfeataa afEismsl & fRarem 'y fag g
=0T % wfagerE % fad off fear s a%m."" wenfya fee S,

et : | o v Wl
ARE {3 A, R0¢ TRITE
ey,

%ﬂuia, feier 19 SFE 2018

F. 1124-19-TFHIG-31-(. ). —WRd & GfauH % ST 348 T WU (3) % TG H, HLAYQ TRUlferes fafy
(Seirer) TRy, 2018 (SHHIH 3 W 2018) 1 ST AR ToIUA % WUHR & TGN Fifv fopar < €.

HEAYRY & TSI & A ¥ a1 STRIMTER,
YT ArEa, efafie afea.

MADHYA PRADESH ORDINANCE
No.3 or 2018

THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHYADESH, 2018
[First published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 19" January, 2018.]

Promulgated by the Governor in the sixty-eighth year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amed the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and the
Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961.

WHEREAS, the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is satisfied
that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action;



72 (2) Heayey TN9H, fEAiw 19 SFeRt 2018

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of the Constitution
of India, the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance :—

Short title. 1. This Ordinance may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhyadesh, 2018.

Madhya Pradesh 2. During the period of operation of this Ordinance, the Madhya Pradesh Municipal
‘1‘;5‘ Go B Azf Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956) and the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No.
No. 37 of 1961 to 37 of 1961) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in sections 3 and 4. :

be temporarily

amended.
PART I
AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT, 1956
(No. 23 OF 1956)
Amendment to 3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956), in Section

the Madhya 133-A, in sub-section (1),—
Pradesh Act No.

23 of 1956. .
@) for the words "two per centum", the words "three per centum" shall be

substituted;

(ii) for the words "The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Corporation
" shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects or for
repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or on behalf
; of the concerned Municipal Corporation.", the words "The amount of duty so
received may be used for urban infrastructure development, affordable housing
' projects, urban transport including metro rail or such other projects in urban areas.
This amount so received may also be used for repayment of .loans taken for

implementation of aforementioned projects.” shall be substituted.

PART 1I

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPALLITIES ACT, 1961 (No. 37 OF 1961)

Amendment to 4. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961), in Section 161, in sub-

the Madhya .
Pradesh Act No. section (1),—

37 of 1961.
(1) for the words "two per centum", the words "three per centum” shall be

substituted;

(ii) for the words "The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Council or Nagar
Parishad shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects
or for repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or behalf
of the concerned Munisipal Council or Nagar Parishad:”, the words "The amount
of duty so received may be used for urban infrastructure development, affordable
housing projects, urban transport including metro rail or such other projects in
urban areas. This amount so received may also be used for repayment of loans
taken for implementation of aforementioned projects, " shall be substituted.

BHOPAL : OM PRAKASH KOHLI
DATED THE 12th January, 2018 Governor,
Madhya Pradesh.

i, TEwT YR T T AR, TRy N W F e, diae @ giia e w2018,



